
 

 

ANNOUNCEMENTS  10.18.18 
 

Link to submit a new announcement:    
https://goo.gl/forms/CZxxZrVOQbZnf4563 

 
Good morning Cary High…Please stand for the Pledge of Allegiance ( count to 5) 
 
I pledge allegiance to the flag of the United States of America. And to the republic for which it 
stands. One nation, under God, indivisible, with liberty and justice for all. 
 
TODAY 
 
Picture make-ups are scheduled for October 22. Make sure you get your picture taken for the 
yearbook and next years’ lunch passes! This includes seniors!  
 
Seniors, this week CFNC (College Foundation of North Carolina) is sponsoring College 
Application Week, a time when some colleges in North Carolina waive their application fees to 
students who submit their applications via C.F.N.C.org (not via another website). Counselors will 
be available during IMPact today in the Career Center to assist with college applications. Laptops 
will be provided.  Colleges that are waiving application fees this week will waive the fees until 5pm 
tomorrow. For more information, go to www.nccountdowntocollege.org. 
 
Want to spend Spring Break in Paris & Italy? See Mrs. Allen in twenty two sixteen, beside the 
second floor elevator, for more information.  Spots are limited so sign up today. 
 
WRAL Explorer Post 5 Open House is tonight from 7-8 pm at the studios on Western Boulevard.  
This is a great way to gain TV experience for a broadcasting career.  More about Post 5 is available 
at the open house, online or stop by Room 2134 for a flyer.     
 
IDEA Club invites you to Paint Your Purpose on Cary’s sidewalks! Stop by 2328 during lunch 
today to plan and then painting with chalk after school. 
 
There will be a FBLA meeting today, during A lunch in Room 2210 to discuss Regional 
Conference and Competitive Events.  
 
The History Movies Club will meet today during lunch in Room 410 to continue watching Clash of 
the Titans. 
 
Are you interested in participating on the Winter Track Team....There will be an informational 
meeting today during A lunch in room 2222. See Coach Dotson if you cannot attend. 
 
There will be a Science Olympiad meeting today in Room 302. 
 
You are cordially invited to the Fall Choral Concert tonight at 7:00 p.m. in the auditorium. Cost is 
$2 for students, $5 for adults. Come for an enjoyable evening of music! 



 

 

 
Congrats to the soccer team who defeated Athens in a penalty kick shootout. Cary Goal scored by 
Leo Velasquez, Assist by Alex Dako. Brandon Bartley in goal. Penalty kicks were scored by Daniel 
Rodriguez, Sean Nolan, Alex Dako, Ben Nazar, and Devin Faison. Next home game on Wednesday 
 
 
TOMORROW 
 
Environmental Club members will be out tomorrow and next Wednesday in the gym lobby, 11 
building and 2000 lobby collecting your signature for the "Skip the Straw" campaign. Please join to 
reduce plastic waste.  
 
Ambassadors meeting tomorrow during A lunch in the Career Center.  All members are required to 
attend.  
 
SkillsUSA meeting tomorrow during lunch in 2111. This is the last day to turn in your dues. 
 
FCA meeting tomorrow in room 2206! Lunch will be provided!  
 
Attention Cary High Staff members please submit your coffee/tea order every Monday by 8am for 
the OCS Cary High School Beverage Company!  
 
Be sure to follow us on twitter at cary underscore chatter for more announcements.  
 
Have a great day, Cary. 
 
ON HOLD 
 
10/22 -The homecoming bonfire is Monday 11/5 from 7-9 at Phillips Farm. Join us for smores, 
drinks, music, and fall fun! Admission $8 at the gate. 
 
The CHS Kiva Club meeting will be on Tuesday, 10/23, during "A" lunch in room 303. Come 
ready to to help global entrepreneurs get their start. All are welcome. 
 
New NTHS members must pay the $31 registration fee by October 23rd in room 2210. See Mrs 
York with questions. 
 
Bonjour French Club Members. Your next meeting is Wednesday, October 24 at 2:45 in 2309. You 
will be watching a short film and enjoying croissants. Bring your $1 dues if you haven't already 
paid. 



 

 

 
The REAL Tigers are Carolina Tiger Rescue. Join the Environmental Club this Thursday Oct 25th 
to learn more. 
 
10/26 - Attention FCA! There will be a meeting this Friday in room 2206! Lunch will be provided! 
See you there! 
 
New club on campus, the Sci-Fi and Fantasy Club will have an interest meeting on October 23 in 
Room 2222 during A lunch.  All are invited.  
 
Cary’s student-run newspaper, “The Page”, has launched! Find them at chsthepage.com and join 
them on Tuesdays in 2324 to write. 
 
The Cary High GSA meets on Tuesdays in room 206 from 2:30 to 3:30. All are welcome.  
 
10/31, 11/14/, 12/5, 12/19, 1/16, 1/30, 2/13, 2/27, 3/13, 3/27, 4/10, 5/1, 5/15, 5/29-  
The Army recruiter will be in the gym lobby Wednesday during lunch.  Stop by and explore the 
many exciting careers the Army offers.  
 
10/24, 11/7, 11/28, 12,12, 1/9, 1/23, 2/6, 2/20, 3/6, 3/20, 4/3, 4/24, 5/8, 5/22, 6/5 -  
The Army recruiter will be in the 11 building main lobby Wednesday during lunch.  Stop by and 
explore the many exciting careers the Army offers. 
 
History Movies Club is a real easy club to join. Meetings are during lunch on Thursdays in Room 
four ten. Bring your lunch & eat while you watch the movie.  
 
The recruiter from The New School in New York will be in the gym lobby on Oct. 25 during lunch. 
Visit the recruiter if you are interested.  
 
The Vanderbilt University rep will be in the gym lobby during lunch on Monday, Oct. 29. Visit her 
to ask about attending Vanderbilt. 
 
Eckerd College will be in the gym lobby Friday, October 26.  Stop by and see how you can become 
a Triton. 
 
Thanks to you, Ambassadors have collected close to 100 wands to be used by the Appalachian 
Wildlife Refuge (ref-huge) to care for abandoned and orphaned animals.  The used mascara wands 
are the perfect size to gently comb new feathers and fur. Wands are still accepted so lend a hand 
and bring your mascara wands to 2134.  Go to appalachianwild.org for more information. 
 



 

 

 


